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          December 17, 2009 
 
Chairman Graham and Members of the Board: 
 
I am pleased to present you with the Riders’ Advisory Council report for December 2009.  
 
WMATA Partners Panel Discussion 
At its December meeting, the Council hosted a panel discussion featuring Craig Simpson, from 
ATU Local 689; Matt Bassett, Virginia representative to the Tri-State Oversight Committee 
(TOC); and Helen Lew, WMATA Inspector General.  The three panelists briefly described the 
missions of their organizations and how they interact with WMATA.  As you may expect, many 
of the questions revolved around safety.   
 
Mr. Bassett described the structure of the TOC, highlighting the interjurisdictional nature of the 
body.  He did mention that the TOC is leanly staffed, although hoping to see more staffing in 
the near future.  He also mentioned that the TOC is developing a website and determining 
how to share information with the public.  He shared that the TOC plans to share the minutes 
of its meetings on its website, and is considering holding public forums to share information 
with the public.  In response to questions, he did say that the lack of any right to access to the 
tracks was a challenge, and was appreciative of the Board’s recent efforts in this area.  Again 
in response to questions, he conveyed that there is neither FTA or TOC has any enforcement 
authority specific to a particular rail transit system, and, in fact, WMATA funding could be at 
risk if a rail transit system elsewhere in Maryland or Virginia experienced safety violations.  He 
also compared the TOC’s resources to those of other State Safety Organizations.   
 
Mr. Simpson described ATU Local 689’s range of activity, relationship to other WMATA unions, 
and some of their current goals.  He mentioned that the Local 689 is refocusing on safety 
following recent events.   
 
Ms. Lew, as the first WMATA Inspector General, described the changing role of her office—
from Auditor to Inspector General—and the breadth of the work her office conducts.  In 
response to questions, she mentioned that her office has helped WMATA achieve $30 million 
in savings in the 2.5 years since her position was created. 
 
 
Budget Options 
The Council approved a letter memorializing our concerns and suggestions for this year’s 
budget discussion.  While we realize that technical or practical considerations may make it 
prohibitive to enact some of these suggestions for Fiscal 2011—for instance, it is not clear that 
the SmarTrip program will have the capability of carrying three-tiered fare systems or pass 
products by July 2010—these are nonetheless options the R.A.C. believes that WMATA should 
consider and analyze and take preliminary steps to investigate.  The Board Office distributed 
the letter last week and a copy is attached here as well for your convenience. 



 
Bus Priority Corridor Network 
The Council also approved a letter to area local governments requesting they do their part to 
support the Bus Priority Corridor Network.  As we have discussed before, many of the pieces 
necessary to promote efficient bus service are outside of WMATA’s control.  We hope this 
letter will encourage local governments to work with WMATA to make bus service throughout 
the region as effective as possible. 
 
 
Bylaw Amendments 
The Council also enacted a series of Bylaw amendments which have already been forwarded 
to the Board.  We hope that you will take action today on the amendments.  The Council 
requested that the Board enact today any amendments that the Board agrees with.  If there 
are some amendments that the Board would like to further consider, the Council urged me to 
make ourselves available to the Board to discuss why we felt these changes are important.   
 
 
Concerns of Mr. Michael Sindram 
Mr. Michael Sindram, who spoke during the public comment period at the November Board 
meeting, also shared his letters with me and asked me to provide assistance to him in my role 
as Chair of the R.A.C.  I passed on Mr. Sindram’s letters to Ms. Lew’s office and to Patrick 
Sheehan, the Chair of the AAC and At-Large Member of the R.A.C. as well as all Members of 
the R.A.C. in attendance at our December 2 meeting. 
 
 
Comings and Goings 
The Council says goodbye to one of our founding Members, Susan Holland, Prince George’s 
County.   
 
This is the last Board meeting of 2009, and as such the last Board meeting of my term.  It has 
been a challenging year for everyone involved in WMATA, I believe we have worked together 
to make this system better, and will continue to do so. 
 
 
Thank you very much for you time.  I am happy to answer any questions you may have. 
 
Diana Zinkl, JD/MCP 
Chair, WMATA Riders’ Advisory Council 








